T ——— Office of the District Superintendent
: PO Box 231, 40 West Main Street
BOCES Canton, NY 13617

Phone: (315) 386-4504 + Fax: (315) 386-2099
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Creating Meaningful Lives

Thomas R. Burns
Board of Cooperative Educational Services District Superintendent/Executive Officer

SURPLUS BID RESULTS - NOVEMBER 2018

LOCATION
ID# | QTY SEAWAY TECH BIDS HIGHEST BIDDER
7225 SH 56
NORWOOD
1 1 10" DELTA UNISAW 2-$36.66 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $205
TITLTING TABLE SAW 11-$205
12-$152
13-$5
14-$6.95
21-125
22-$26
2 1 JET METAL CUTTING 12-$127 12 DON STRADER- $127
SAW 13-$5
17-$60
22-$53
3 1 INFINITY PAINT 8-$30 22 TIM BRADY- $56
SPRAYER 12-$2
13-$5
17-$12.50
21- $21
22-$56
4 1 ROCKWELL HEAVY 2-$36.66 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $152
DUTY SHAPER 11-$152
12-$152
21-$35
22-$121
11 1 POWERMATIC 2-$4.55 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $45
SPINDEL SANDER 4-$1.01
11-$45
12-$21
22-$36
12 1 GAST PAINT SPRAYER 8-$20 22 TIM BRADY- $50
12-$2
13-$5
17-$12.50
22-$50
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13 1 13 GALLON 6-$3 22 TIM BRADY- $11
BLK/SILVER TRASH 11-$1
CAN 12-$2
20-$5
22-$11
14 1 13 GALLON BLI/GOLD 6-$2.15 22 TIM BRADY- $11
TRASH CAN 10-$2
12-$2
22-$11
15 1 44 GALLON 6-$5.75 8 BILL VINE- $20
BLK/SILVER TRASH 8-$20
CAN 12-$2
20-$5
16 1 YARDMAN 12-$3 22 TIM BRADY- $26
SNOWBLOWER 14-31
22-$26
17 1 RIGID 535 PIPER 11-$41 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $41
THREADER 12-$11
13-$10
15-$35
14-$25
20-$10
20 1 CEMENT MIXER 2-$21.56 17 MIKE RODENHOUSE- $25
12-$2
17-$25
22-$23
22 1 SNOW BOSS 92" 17-$15 22 TIM BRADY- $125
POWER VXTPLOW 22-$125
(FOIL NOT INCLUDED)
24 1 GEKA HYDRA CROP 12-$120 17 MIKE RODENHOUSE- $125
100 SHEARER 17-$125
25 1 DELTA TABLE SAW (AS 11-$31 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $31
IS) 12-$2
26 1 BENCH TOP DRILL 2- $20.55 22 TIM BRADY- $22
PESS 12-$3
22-$22
27 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell 1-$10 1 TARA REYNOLDS- $10
LOT 27-32 as 1 lot)
28 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 27-32 as 1 lot)
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29 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 27-32 as 1 lot)

30 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 27-32 as 1 lot))

31 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 27-32 as 1 lot)

32 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 27-32 as 1 lot)

33 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell 14-$10 14 LARRY ASHLEY- $10
LOT 33-38 as 1 lot)

34 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 33-38 as 1 lot)

35 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 33-38 as 1 lot)

36 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 33-38 as 1 lot)

37 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 33-38 as 1 lot)

38 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 33-38 as 1 lot)

39 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 39-44 as 1 lot)

40 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 39-44 as 1 lot)

41 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 39-44 as 1 lot)

42 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 39-44 as 1 lot)

43 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 39-44 as 1 lot)

44 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 39-44 as 1 lot)

45 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 45-50 as 1 lot)

46 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 45-50 as 1 lot)

47 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS NO BID
LOT (sell 45-50as 1 lot)

48 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell 11-$42 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $42
LOT 45-50as 1 lot)
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49 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 45-50as 1 lot)
50 1 6 COSMO CHAIRS (sell NO BID
LOT 45-50 as 1 lot)
LOCATION
ID# | QTY NORTHWEST TECH BIDS HIGHEST BIDDER
1000 PARK ST.
OGDENSBURG
51 1 2007 CHEVY IMPALA(as 9-$300 12 DON STRADER- $751
is- does not run) 12-$751
13-$151.50
17-$110
22-$676
53 1 BLACKHAWK 2.5 TON 12-$2 17- MIKE RODENHOUSE- $65
END LIFT 17-$65
54 1 2 PIECE SINK & 2-$1 22 TIM BRADY- $32
COUNTERTOP 22-$32
55 1 CLEVELAND STEAM 2-$15.55 2 PHIL MURPHY- $15.55
KETTLE 12-$7
56 1 CLEVELAND STEAM 2-$15.56 2 PHIL MURPHY- $15.56
KETTLE 12-$7
59 18 18 BUNDLES ICO BLK 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
SHINGLES
60 1 POWER BUFF FLOOR NO BID
MACHINE
61 1 METAL DESK NO BID
62 1 METAL DESK NO BID
63 1 METAL SHELF NO BID
64 1 METAL DESK NO BID
65 1 HOBART DISH 12-$2 21 GLEN PERRY- $101
MACHINE 21-$101
66 3 3 BOXES LOUVERS 60” 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
OPEN WINDOW
67 1 7 PIECE KITCHEN 12-%1 14 LARRY ASHELY- #50
CUPBOARDS 14-$50
22-$32
68 1 6’ TABLE 1-$10 1 TARA REYNOLDS- $10
12-$3
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70 1 MILLERMATIC 251 1-$50 19 ETHYN MOQUIN- $325
WELDER 5-$202
7-$56
9-$75
12-$3
16-$251
17-$10
19-$325
22-$22
71 1 LINCOLN SP-175 5-$202 5 AARON SHERMAN- $202
ELECTRIC WELDER 7-$26
12-$11
16-$76
17-$10
22-$22
72 1 8” JET BENCH 1-$25 16 STEVE ADAMS- $26
GRINDER 2-$12.55
12-$11
16-$26
17-$10
22-$22
73 2 2 BOXES BRUCE 2-$11.56 2 PHIL MURPHY- $11.56
HARDWOOD
FLOORING TOAST
COLOR
74 1 HEIN-WERNER 1.5 TON 3-$50.25 3 SHEILA SHARP- $50.25
55R LIFT 12-$2
17-$10
75 1 HUSQUVARNA PUSH 12-$1 13 PAUL COFFEY- $2
MOWER (as is) 13-$2
1 SNAP-ON SCRIBE I 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
76 MT3010 DIAGNOSTIC
MACHINE
1 HUNTER WA340 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
77 DIAGNOSTIC MACHINE
78 1 3” DRYWALL SCREWS 10-$2 12 DON STRADER- $11
12-$11
13-$2
17-$1.75
18-$5
22-$3
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81 1 8X2-1/2” DECK LOCK 10-$7 16 STEVE ADAMS- $36
SCREWS 12-$11
13-$2
16-$36
17-$5
18-$10
22-$3
83 1 6X2” DECK LOCK 10-$7 16 STEVE ADAMS- $21
SCREWS 12-$11
13-$2
16-$21
17-$5
22-$3
84 1 6X2” DRYWALL 10-$2 12 DON STRADER- $11
SCREWS 12-$11
13-$2
17-$3
18-$5
22-$3
86 1 2" DECK LOCK 10-$5 16 STEVE ADAMS- $21
SCREWS 12-$11
13-$2
16-$21
17-$3
18-$5
22-$3

87 1 3" DECK SCREWS 4-$5.02 16 STEVE ADAMS- $36
10-$7
12-$11
13-$2
16-$36
17-$5
18-$5
22-$3
88 1 2" PHOSPHATE 4-$3.02 12 DON STRADER- $11
BOGLEHEAD SCREWS 12-$11
13-$2
89 1 KITCHEN AID NO BID
DISHWASHER (as is)
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91 3 SET OF 2 12-$6 12 DON STRADER- $6
MASTERCRAFT
COURSER TIRES ON
RIMS STUDDED SNOW
TIRES SIZE LT245-
75R16
92 1 CRAFTSMAN 10” 12-$6 12 DON STRADER- $6
MITER SAW
93 1 DELTA FRAME & TRIM 12-$6 12 DON STRADER- $6
SAW 13-$2
177 1 AMANA WASHER 12-$1 22 TIM BRADY- $15
22-$15
178 1 GENERAL ROD 12-$2 17 MIKE RODENHOUSE- $12.50
RUNNER SEWER 17-$12.50
MACHINE W/CABLE
210 1 OVERBED TABLE 6-$4.50 6 ERIN MURPHY- $4.50
211 1 OVERBED TABLE 6-$7.10 6 ERIN MURPHY-$7.10
212 19 19 PIECES OF 4’X3/4’ 2-$5.55 8 BILL VINE- $20
ELECTRICAL CONDUIT 8-$20
12-$1
213 1 2 DRAWER METAL NO BID
DESK
214 1 STAINLESS STEEL 12-$1 20 JODY WILLIAMS- $10
SINK W/FAUCET 20-$10
22-$8
215 1 4 DRAWER METAL FILE 12-$1 14 LARRY ASHLEY- $15
CABINET 14-$15
216 1 2 DRAWER FILE 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
CABINET
217 1 2 DRAWER FILE 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
CABINET
218 1 7FT. BLUE 12-$1 14 LARRY ASHLEY- $10
COUNTERTOP 14-$10
219 1 4 DRAWER FILE 2-$4.55 14 LARRY ASHLEY- $20
CABINET 12-$1
14-$20
220 1 RECUMBANT BIKE 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
221 1 MILWAKEE CHOP SAW 1-$25 1 TARA REYNOLDS- $25
14-3$1
22-$15
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LOCATION
ID# | QTY | ST. LAWRENCE-LEWIS BIDS HIGHEST BIDDER
BOCES,
40 WEST MAIN ST.
CANTON
21 1 GRAY METAL DESK NO BID
WITH VENEER TOP
23 1 BLK/GRY METAL DESK NO BID
97 1 2 DRAWER DESK NO BID
RETURN
100 1 TAN METAL W/VENEER NO BID
TOP CORNER
COMPUTER STATION
101 1 2 DRAWER METAL NO BID
DESK
102 1 MAROON DESK GUEST 4-$1.02 4 FRANK TARASKA- $1.02
CHAIR
104 1 WOODEN 3 SHELF NO BID
BOOKCASE
105 1 WOODEN 2 SHELF NO BID
FILE CABINET
107 1 REFIGERATOR 12-$2 22 TIM BRADY- $10
22-$10
109 |1 GUEST CHAIR 4-$1.02 4 FRANK TRASKA- $1.02
110 1 GUEST CHAIR 4-$1.02 4 FRANK TRASKA- $1.02
112 1 REFRIGERATOR 12-$2 15 CRAIG LALONDE- $38
15-$38
22-$16
113 1 METAL TABLE NO BID
W/WOOD VENEER TOP
115 1 2 PIECE BLK/GRY NO BID
METAL DESK
116 1 5’ ROUND TABLE 4-$10.02 4 FRANK TRASKA- $10.02
118 1 SMALL 2 SHELF TABLE NO BID
119 1 MAYON BASE STATION 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
RADIO
120 1 METAL 2 DRAWER NO BID
LATERAL FILE
CABINET
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121 1 SOLID WOOD DESK 12-$1 15 CRAIG LALONDE- $222
W/GLASS TOP 15-$222
122 1 SMALL METAL BLK NO BID
TABLE W/WOOQOD
VENEER TOP
123 1 SOLID WOOD DESK NO BID
124 1 METAL DESK W/ NO BID
WOOD VENEER TOP
222 2 2 CORDLESS PHONES NO BID
LOCATION
ID# | QTY SOUTHWEST TECH BIDS HIGHEST BIDDER
3606 NY 58,
GOUVERNEUR
126 3 3 BXS. GLASS NO BID
DESSERT CUPS
128 1 LRG. BX. POTS, PANS, 4-$3.02 12 DON STRADER- $6
DISHES, UTENCILS 12-$6
130 4 LOT OF 4 SALON NO BID
CHAIRS AS IS
131 8 LOT OF MISC. CHILD NO BID
SIZE CHAIRS
132 2 2 KIDS SHOPPING NO BID
CARTS
133 2 2 LITTLE TYKES CARS NO BID
134 1 BX. OF CDS W/KIDS NO BID
MUSIC BOOKS
135 KIDS COAT CUBBY NO BID
138 1 LAKESHORE WOODEN REMOVED
CABINET W/TOYS
141 1 7.5 hp PHASE 3 MOTOR 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
17-$2
142 6 6 STUDENT CHAIRS(3 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
BLUE-3 MAROON)
143 1 DRILL PRESS 11-$65 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $65
12-$11
13-$2
22-$18
144 5 4 TOTES, & 1 BG. 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
MATERIAL &

DECORATIONS
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146 1 LOW TABLE ON NO BID
WHEELS
147 1 LOT OF MISC. 4-$3.02 4 FRANK TRASKA- $3.02
KITCHEN & COFFEE
POTS
148 1 PALLET OF MISC NO BID
BOOKS
149 1 METAL DESK NO BID
150 2 2 BASKET FRYERAS IS | 4-$52.02 4 FRANK TRASKA- $52.02
12-$1
151 3 LOT OF 3 TRIKES NO BID
W/HELMETS
152 3 3 BULLETIN BOARDS NO BID
153 1 BX. OF MISC. SHELVES NO BID
& MAGAZINE RACKS
154 1 MISC. OUTDOOR TOYS 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
LOT
155 1 APRON RACK W/ NO BID
PAINT & ART ITEMS
156 1 BX. OF TOYS NO BID
159 1 CONVECTION OVEN- NO BID
DOES NOT WORK
161 1 WHITE SINK NO BID
162 1 BLK. METAL DESK NO BID
163 1 HOBART MIXER 4-$52.03 4 FRANK TRASKA- $52.03
12-$15
164 1 MICROWAVE OVEN NO BID
166 3 3 BXS. TOYS NO BID
167 1 NON-LOCKING CPU NO BID
LOT CRADLE
168 1 GRY GUEST CHAIR NO BID
169 1 BLK METAL DESK NO BID
WITH BROWN WOOD
VENEER
170 1 BROWN DESK RETURN NO BID
171 1 2 DRAWER WOOD NO BID
VENEER DESK
172 1 TWIN MOTOR AIR 11-$88 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $88
COMPRESSER W/TANK 12-$11

AND CONTROLS

17-$65
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173 1 BLK METAL CART 8-$25 8 BILL VINE- $25
W/ELECTRICAL 12-$11
SUPPLIES 17-$6
22-$5
174 1 SINK W/2 BASE 14-$5 14 LARRY ASHLEY- $5
CABINETS
175 1 PALLET OF CLEANING 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
SUPPLIES
179 1 4 DRAWER METAL FILE 2-31 13 PAUL COFFEY- $15.00
CABINET 13-$15.00
180 1 5 DRAWER METAL FILE 12-$2 13 PAUL COFFEY- $17.50
CABINET 13-$17.50
15-$17
181 1 1 BOX OF NO BID
ELECTRONICS BOOKS
182 1 GRAY METAL DESK NO BID
183 5 5 METAL TRASH CANS 6-$12.75 8 BILL VINE- $40.00
8-$40
12-$2
184 4 LOT OF 4- 6 FT. 11-$30 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $30.00
TABLES 12-$11
13-$2.50
18-$20
185 11 11 BXS.- 20" 3M 3500 NO BID
NATURAL BLEND TAN
PADS FOR FLOOR
MACHINE
186 4 4 BXS.- 20" 3M 3100 13-$2 13 PAUL COFFEY- $2
AQUA PADS FOR
FLOOR MACHINE
187 2 2 BXS.- 20" 3M 4200 8-$10 8 BILL VINE- $10
BEIGE PADS FOR 13-$2
FLOOR MACHINE
189 4 4 BXS.- 20" BRILLO 8-$20 8 BILL VINE- $20
HAIR PADS V432012 13-$2
190 1 6 FT. TABLE 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
191 1 6 FT. TABLE 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
192 1 6 FT. TABLE 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
195 1 3 DRAWER CABINET NO BID
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196 1 2 DRAWER FILE NO BID
CABINET
197 6 PLASTIC STORAGE NO BID
CONTAINERS
198 2 2 OVERHEAD 13-$2 13 PAUL COFFEY- $2
PROJECTORS
200 6 6 BAGS OF LAPTOP NO BID
CASES
201 1 TRIPLE BEAM 11-$8 11 HENRY HIRSHBERGER- $8
BALANCE SCALE 13-$3
17-$1
202 1 5 DRAWER FILE NO BID
CABINET
204 1 PALLET OF MISC. NO BID
BOOKS
205 1 2 DRAWER METAL NO BID
DESK
206 1 COMPUTER STATION NO BID
207 1 2 DRAWER METAL NO BID
DESK
208 1 MOBILE SMARTBOARD NO BID
STAND
209 1 PALLET OF MISC. 12-$2 13 PAUL COFFEY- $2
SIZED CONSTRUCTION 13-$2
PAPER
223 1 LECTURN ON WHEELS 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
224 1 SHELF NO BID
225 1 SHELF NO BID
226 1 AV CART ON WHEELS 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
228 1 FEDERAL MOGUL 12-$1 17 MIKE RODENHOUSE- $2
ENGINE PRE- 17-$2
LUBRICATOR
229 1 PAPER CUTTER 12-$6 12 DON STRADER- $6
230 1 BX OF OLD AUTO 12-$1 12 DON STRADER- $1
REPAIR MANUALS
232 2 TWO METAL WALL NO BID
MOUNT MAGAZINE
RACKS
233 1 COMPUTER STATION NO BID

ON CASETERS
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234 | 1 PLASTIC SHELF NO BID
235 | 1 MISC. DISHES 1-$5 1 TARA REYNOLDS- $5
LOT 12-$1
20-$5
236 | 1 WOK 4-$2.02 4 FRANK TARASKA- $2.02
12-$2
237 | 2 | (1)SALAD SHOOTER & | 4-$1.02 4 FRANK TARASKA- $1.02
(L)MIXER 12-$1
238 | 1 MISC. COOKWARE 1-$5 4 FRANK TARASKA - $11.03
LOT 4-$11.03
12-$6
20-$10
239 | 13 CUTTING BOARDS 8-$10 20 JODY WILLIAMS- $10
12-$1
20-$10
240 | 1 AUTO TEST 12-$2 12 DON STRADER- $2
LOT EQUIPMENT




