

BIDS WILL BE OPENED
ON THURSDAY, DECEMBER
4, 2014 AT 11:00 AM
AT THE BOCES CENTRAL
OFFICE, CANTON, NY 13617
(315) 386-4504

NAME OF COMPANY _____

ADDRESS _____

PHONE _____ DATE _____

BID

Surplus Auction

Specifications for the sale of miscellaneous equipment at:
Northwest Technical Center, 1000 Park Street, Ogdensburg, NY
Seaway Area Technical Center, 7225 SH 56, Norwood, NY
Southwest Technical Center, 3606 SH 58, Gouverneur, NY
Educational Services Center, 40 Wet Main Street, Canton, NY

Items may be viewed at each location from 9 am to 3 pm weekdays.

BIDS WILL BE OPENED AT

40 West Main Street

PO BOX 231

CANTON, NEW YORK

**AT 11:00 AM, BY SUSAN COLLINS-RICKETT, DISTRICT CLERK
ON THURSDAY, DECEMBER 4, 2014**

BY: Susan Collins-Rickett, District Clerk
St. Lawrence-Lewis Counties BOCES
PO Box 231, 40 West Main Street
Canton, NY 13617
(315) 386-4504 (Ext. 10149)

**BID SPECIFICATIONS
FOR ST. LAWRENCE-LEWIS COUNTIES BOCES
NORTHWEST TECHNICAL CENTER
SEAWAY AREA TECHNICAL CENTER
SOUTHWEST TECHNICAL CENTER
EDUCATIONAL SERVICES CENTER (CANTON)**

NOTES:

- 1: Surplus items are to be sold as is, where is, to the highest bidder**
- 2: Successful bidders have 7 days from the date of the award letter to pay for and remove items.**
- 3: Items not removed after the 7 day period will constitute a forfeiture and be disposed of immediately.**
- 4: All bids must include a completed BID Tabulation Sheet (below) and Non-Collusive Bidding Certification (attached with specs). Failure to comply will result in rejection of bid.**

If you have any questions, please call Kevin Perretta, Director of Facilities, St. Lawrence-Lewis BOCES, 40 West Main Street, PO Box 231, Canton, NY 13617. (315)386-4504 X-10278.

<u>LOCATION / ITEM</u>	<u>BID PRICE</u>
NORTHWEST TECH, 1000 PARK ST, OGDENSBURG	
1 – HOBART COMMERCIAL SALAD CHOPPER	\$ NO BID
1 – ICE CREAM FREEZER Frank Taraska	\$ 10.00
60 PLACE RESTAURANT DISHES	\$ NO BID
1 – MILLER WIRE WELDER Relief Rentals, William Walck DBA	\$ 27.52
3 – SALON CHAIR HAIR DRYERS	\$ NO BID
2 –ELECTRIC HOSPITAL BEDS	\$ NO BID
1 – IDEAL ARC WELDER Relief Rentals, William Walck DBA	\$ 131.51
44 – 1 PIECE STUDENT DESKS	\$ REJECT
2 – 2 STATION SALON PORTABLE MIRRORS	\$ NO BID
1 – 3’ WOOD LATHE Chip Stemples	\$ 89.99
1 – LG FRONT LOAD WASHER	\$ NO BID
1 – 24” SHEET METAL BENDER -Relief Rentals, William Walck DBA	\$ 37.26
1 – 20” GRIZZLY PLANER Relief Rentals, William Walck DBA	\$ 277.51
1 – GRIZZLY PORTABLE DUST COLLECTOR - Relief Rentals, William Walck DBA	\$ 146.02
1 – J-LINE BAND SAW Craig Lalonde	\$ 20.00
1 – HOBART ARC WELDER	\$ NO BID
1 – JOINTER Craig Lalonde	\$ 20.00
1 – BELT DISC SANDER Eric Burke	\$ 25.00
1 – RIGID 535 PIPE CUTTER THREADER H. Bros. Porta Potties	\$ 75.00
3 – SERVING TRAY STANDS	\$ NO BID
1 – WHEELCHAIR	\$ NO BID
1 – QUINCY AIR COMPRESSOR 2435 3 PHASE	\$ NO BID

1 – 1994 GMC DUMP TRUCK - Blue	\$ REJECT
1 – 1994 GMC DUMP TRUCK – Black Timothy T. Brady Construction	\$ 1,200.00
1 – 2000 DAEWOO CAR –	\$ NO BID
1 – STAINLESS STEEL SERVING LINE	\$ NO BID
NORTHWEST TECH TOTAL	\$ 2,059.81
SEAWAY TECH, 7225 SH 56, NORWOOD	
1 – 24’ LONG X 8’ WIDE FLAT BED TANDEM AXLE TRAILER – Snyder Farms	\$ 287.50
1 – ENGINE STEAMER / PARTS WASHER SNAP ON PBC55	\$ NO BID
1 – LESSON FRESH AIR PUMP 1725 RPM MULTI VOLTAGE PUMP WITH DRYER Frank Taraska	\$ 10.00
1 – FRESH AIR SUPPLIED HELMET Frank Taraska	\$ 5.00
1 – STACKABLE WASHER/DRYER	\$ NO BID
1 – TIRE MACHINE COATS 5030 Snyder Farms	\$ 188.00
1 – GLENCO 3 DOOR PASS THROUGH REFRIGERATOR	\$ NO BID
1 – STERILIZER / UV TOWL WARMER	\$ NO BID
1 – SMALL DRIVE ON LIFT Garrett Sharp	\$ 100.00
1 - MTD GAS SNOW SHOVEL 3 HP 21” Timothy T. Brady Construction	\$ 20.00
2 – COMFORT AIR FORCED FURNACE (NG)	\$ NO BID
1 – DUCANE FORCED AIR FURNACE (NG) 125,000 BTU	\$ NO BID
1 – POWER MATIC METAL CUTTING BAND SAW	\$ NO BID
1 – F8800A 8 IN 1 BEAUTY EQUIPMENT	\$ NO BID
3 – DOUBLE HUNG WINDOWS 67” X 52” H. Bros. Porta Potties	\$ 15.00
1 – WHIRLPOOL WATER SOFTENER Tim Jerome	\$ 21.95
1 – FENCING – MISCELLANEOUS	\$ NO BID
1 – STOVE – ELECTRIC	\$ NO BID
1 – 18’ STAINLESS STEEL SERVING LINE	\$ NO BID
1 – SHELLYMATIC MILK COOLER	\$ NO BID
1 – FRYER DOUBLE BASKET Frank Taraska	\$ 21.00
1 – 12 INCH POWERMATIC PLANER	\$ NO BID
1 – 10 INCH JET TABLE SAW Dana LaRue	\$ 50.00
1 – FLOORMODEL WILTON DRILL PRESS Ken Murray	\$ 26.51
1 – 2002 FORD E450 30 PASSENGER VAN Relief Rentals, William Walck DBA	\$ 551.57
1 – 2002 DODGE CARGO VAN	\$ NO BID
1 – 2002 CHEVY VENTURE VAN Dana LaRue	\$ 75.00
SEAWAY TECH TOTAL	\$ 1,371.53
SOUTHWEST TECH, 3606 SH 58, FOWLER	
1 – VULCAN GAS BROILER	\$ NO BID
1 – WOOD BAND SAW JET WBS – 20 – 1 Craig Lalonde	\$ 25.00
1 – WORKSTATION ON WHEELS	\$ NO BID
1 – GLASS FRONT CABINET	\$ NO BID

SEVERAL FILE CABINETS	\$ NO BID
CLASSROOM DESKS, CHAIRS AND COMBOS	\$ NO BID
NUMEROUS DOORS, SOME W/ FRAMES, INTERIOR H. Bros. Porta Potties	\$ 25.00
1 – 3 SHELF IT CART ON WHEELS	\$ NO BID
SEVERAL FOLDING TABLES	\$ NO BID
SEVERAL FOLDING CHAIRS	\$ NO BID
HORN SPEAKERS TORTECH TH 16T W/ TRANSFORMERS	\$ REJECT
4- MICHELIN 245/70/R17 TRUCK TIRES 4 Acre Farm (Danny & Jacob Weldon)	\$ 77.77
1 – AIR COMPRESSOR H. Bros. Porta Potties	\$ 25.00
1 – DELTA SANDER DISC AND BELT COMBO 4 Acre Farm (Danny & Jacob Weldon)	\$ 5.00
2 - WATER COOLERS	\$ NO BID
1 – SMALL WATER SOFTENER	\$ NO BID
1 – OVERHEAD DOOR TRACK, OPENERS AND MISC. HARDWARE	\$ NO BID
1 – MISC. ELECTRICAL ITEMS H. Bros. Porta Potties	\$ 10.00
PALLETS OF LANDSCAPE BRICKS/BLOCKS – Nichole Deruchia	\$ 50.00
1 – SHOWER UNIT H. Bros. Porta Potties	\$ 10.00
1 – REDDY HEATER Frank Taraska	\$ 3.00
1 – 1999 DODGE CARAVAN	\$ NO BID
1 – 1999 FORD TAURUS Timothy T. Brady Construction	\$ 100.00
SOUTHWEST TECH TOTAL	\$ 330.77
EDUCATIONAL SERVICES CENTER, 40 W. MAIN ST, CANTON	
1 – 1989 KUBOTA L2050 W/ A KUBOTA BF400S BUCKET L20500-50105 Timothy T. Brady Construction	\$ 2,225.00
EDUCATIONAL SERVICES CENTER TOTAL	\$ 2,225.00

